PROJECT: Grinding of Trees & Tree Removal in Parks RFB #01
OWNER: City of Hiawatha

BID TABULATION

Awarded Contractor (4, 5 & 6)

Awarded Contractor (1, 2 & 3)

PROJECT NUMBER: 07808027-RFB1

BID DATE: 9/15/2020

Bill Miller Logging

Boomerang Corp.

Rathje Construction Co.

Summit Construction & Mgt., Inc.

Timberline Clearing, LLC

ITEM ITEM
NO. DESCRIPTION
Project 1: Wood Grinding and Disposal, Edgewood Road Site ONLY
1. Lump Sum Price for Grinding of Trees and Disposal of all resulting material S 85,310.04 | $ 95,000.00 | $ 69,200.00 | S - S 89,400.00
2. Type of grinder(s): Morbark 1300B Tub Grinder Horizontal Grinder Bandit Beast 3680 Horizontal No Bid Bandit 3680Track 875HP
1050.H.P. Grinder
3. Other Equipment Used (Example Dump Truck, etc.): Excavator, Semi Tractors w/Trailers N/A See bid for equipment list Timberpro TL35C Feller Buncher,
Jarraff 75' Saw, Deere 245G
Excavator, CAT 299D Skid Loader
4. |Estimated Start Week and End Week of work: 10/4/2020] 9/21/2020] 9/28/2020] 11/20/2020 Start 9/28/20 _ [End 10/31/20
(7 days) (3 weeks)
Project 2: Wood Grinding and Disposal, Stamy Road Site ONLY
1. Lump Sum Price for Grinding of Trees and Disposal of all resulting material S 32,194.67 | $ 32,000.00 | $ 5,950.00 | S - S 24,275.00
2. Type of grinder(s): Morbark 1300B Tub Grinder 1050 Horizontal Grinder Bandit Beast 3680 Horizontal No Bid Bandit 3680Track 875HP
H.P. Grinder
3. Other Equipment Used (Example Dump Truck, etc.): Excavator, Semi Tractors w/Trailers N/A See bid for equipment list Timberpro TL35C Feller Buncher,
Jarraff 75' Saw, Deere 245G
Excavator, CAT 299D Skid Loader
4. |Estimated Start Week and End Week of work: 9/27/2020] 9/21/2020] 9/21/2020] 10/2/2020 Start 9/28/20 __ [End 10/31/20
(3 days) (3 weeks)
Project 3: Wood Grinding and Disposal, Robins Road Site ONLY
1. Lump Sum Price for Grinding of Trees and Disposal of all resulting material S 34,848.37 | $ 42,000.00 | $ 14,450.00 | $ - S 41,205.00
2. Type of grinder(s): Morbark 1300B Tub Grinder 1050 Horizontal Grinder Bandit Beast 3680 Horizontal No Bid Bandit 3680Track 875HP
H.P. Grinder
3. Other Equipment Used (Example Dump Truck, etc.): Excavator, Semi Tractors w/Trailers N/A See bid for equipment list Timberpro TL35C Feller Buncher,
Jarraff 75' Saw, Deere 245G
Excavator, CAT 299D Skid Loader
4. |Estimated Start Week and End Week of work: 9/20/2020] 9/21/2020] 9/21/2020] 10/2/2020 Start 9/28/20 _ [End 10/19/20
(3 days) (3 weeks)
Project 4: Tree Removal, Grinding, and Disposal, Tucker Park Site ONLY
1. Lump Sum Price for Grinding of Trees and Disposal of all resulting material $ 59,375.00 | S 88,000.00 | $ 34,250.00 | $ 49,500.00 | $ 86,920.00
2. Type of grinder(s): Morbark 6600 Horizontal Grinder / Horizontal Grinder Bandit Beast 3680 Horizontal Grinder Please refer to equipment list Bandit 3680Track 875HP
1000 H.P.
3. Other Equipment Used (Example Dump Truck, etc.): Timberpro 830D, Skidders, N/A See bid for equipment list Please refer to equipment list Timberpro TL35C Feller Buncher,
Excavators Jarraff 75' Saw, Deere 245G
Excavator, CAT 299D Skid Loader
4. Estimated Start Week and End Week of work: 9/20/2020 9/21/2020 9/21/2020 10/30/2020] Starting the week of the 21st of  |Start 9/21/20 End 10/5/20
September end 45 days after
(3 days) (3 weeks)
Project 5: Tree Removal, Grinding, and Disposal, Guthridge Park Site ONLY
1. Lump Sum Price for Grinding of Trees and Disposal of all resulting material $ 95,831.83 | S 36,500.00 | $ 98,250.00 | $ 390,000.00 | $ 121,385.00
2. Type of grinder(s): Morbark 6600 Horizontal Grinder / Horizontal Grinder Bandit Beast 3680 Horizontal Grinder Please refer to equipment list Bandit 3680Track 875HP
1000 H.P.
3. Other Equipment Used (Example Dump Truck, etc.): Timberpro 830D, Skidders, N/A See bid for equipment list Please refer to equipment list Timberpro TL35C Feller Buncher,
Excavators Jarraff 75' Saw, Deere 245G
Excavator, CAT 299D Skid Loader
4. Estimated Start Week and End Week of work: 9/27/2020 9/21/2020 9/28/2020 11/6/2020, Starting the week of the 21st of  |Start 9/21/20 End 10/5/20
September end 45 days after
(6 days) (3 weeks)
Project 6: Tree Removal, Grinding, and Disposal, Dave Wright Family Dog Park ONLY
1. Lump Sum Price for Grinding of Trees and Disposal of all resulting material $ 62,500.00 | S 35,200.00 | $ 34,500.00 | $ 32,500.00 | $ -
2. Type of grinder(s): Morbark 6600 Horizontal Grinder / Horizontal Grinder Bandit Beast 3680 Horizontal Grinder Please refer to equipment list No Bid
1000 H.P.
3. Other Equipment Used (Example Dump Truck, etc.): Timberpro, Skid Loader, Log Truck, N/A See bid for equipment list Please refer to equipment list
4. Estimated Start Week and End Week of work: 10/4/2020 9/21/2020 9/28/2020 11/6/2020|  Starting the week of the 21st of
September end 45 days after
(3 days) (3 weeks)
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